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Annex

MACROECONOMIC MANAGEMENT, FINANCIAL
GOVERNANCE, AND DEVELOPMENT:

SELECTED POLICY ISSUES

A.  Introduction

Amongst the topics of the agreed annotations
to the provisional agenda for UNCTAD IX was
the consideration of national and international poli-
cies needed to enable full advantage to be taken of
the opportunities for growth and development of-
fered by the new global context while minimizing
the risks  of new imbalances and instabilities, in-
cluding those in international financial markets.
Greater integration of financial markets has in-
creased the amounts and categories of financing
potentially available to entities throughout the
world economy.     However, so far only a small
minority of entities have actually achieved access
to this financing.  Moreover, the capital movements
which have accompanied financial globalization
have been  associated with greater instability, and
it has been frequently shown how greater financial
openness can restrict autonomy in macroeconomic
management.  These features of financial glob-

alization have been recurring themes of recent is-
sues of the TDR, which have monitored the effects
of, and policy responses to, increased financial
inflows into certain developing countries resulting
from their progressive integration into the global
network of financial markets,1 and have reviewed
major features of the legal framework of interna-
tional financial liberalization as well as selected
policy proposals aimed at the achievement of a
more   stable international financial system.2  The
observations concerning these subjects which fol-
low are based largely on papers presented and
subsequent discussion at the conference, Capital
Flows in Economic Development, organized by the
Global Interdependence Division of UNCTAD in
cooperation with the Jerome Levy Institute of Bard
College on 7-9 March 1996 at Blithewood, the
home of the Institute on the campus of Bard Col-
lege in Annandale-on-Hudson, New York.

B.  Floating exchange rates and the liberalization
of international capital movements

The abandonment of fixed exchange rates by
major OECD countries at the beginning of the
1970s was widely believed at the time to lead to a
system in which countries would have consider-

able autonomy in the pursuit of appropriate na-
tional macroeconomic policies, while exchange
rates themselves would gravitate towards levels set
by purchasing power parities.  However, the out-
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come proved to be different.  Under the new re-
gime of floating exchange rates the international
financial system has been subject to instability in
currency and other financial markets, and has been
notable for levels of exchange rates which have
obstinately diverged for long periods from those
corresponding to economic fundamentals.

Currency volatility under the new regime has
tended to fluctuate, with periods of increased vola-
tility being interspersed with periods of calm.
There have also been shorter episodes of excep-
tional instability in international financial markets,
outstanding recent examples being the disruptions
of the Exchange Rate Mechanism of the European
Monetary System in 1992 and 1993.  The effects
on developing countries of the resulting instability
take place through several channels.  A large part
of both their exports and their imports, as well as
of their debt service obligations, are denominated
in major currencies.  Owing to mismatching of the
denomination of external receipts and outflows
their balance-of-payments positions are generally
sensitive to relative movements in the values of
different currencies and to changes in major inter-
est rates. Moreover, increases in debt-service
obligations resulting from higher interest rates of-
ten coincide with weakening export prospects, also
closely related to dearer money.  More recently, as
the scale of foreign investment in the financial
markets of certain developing countries has in-
creased, these markets have become directly
vulnerable to large shifts in sentiment among in-

ternational investors.  An early example of the
possible effects of such vulnerability was provided
by the collapse of the stock market in Hong Kong
during the crash of October 1987,3 and a more re-
cent one by Mexico�s financial crisis of late 1994
and early 1995, which not only led to a collapse of
the exchange rate of the peso and of the value of
other Mexican financial assets but also had
spillover effects on other emerging financial
markets.

Unsound economic policies can contribute to
global financial instability.  However, a recurrent
lesson of recent experience of such instability is
its frequently tenuous or non-existent connection
to fundamentals such as countries� relative price
levels, microeconomic performance and the stance
of their macroeconomic policies.  This appears to
reflect the lack of a systematic relation between
these fundamentals and the indicators used by ac-
tors in financial markets to guide their decisions
as to holdings of different currencies.  For exam-
ple, much evidence suggests that many of these
actors extensively use trading rules that rely on
extrapolation of past movements and that are thus
capable of perpetuating and accentuating move-
ments of exchange rates frequently divorced from
fundamentals.4  Such behaviour by traders also
probably helps to explain the failure of economic
models to account for short- and medium-term vari-
ations in major exchange rates in terms of variables
such as money supplies, real incomes, interest and
inflation rates, and balances on current account.5

term denotes exchange rates which, at reasonably
full employment for the economy in question, are
inconsistent with a sustainable external payments
position as determined by the balance on current
account and the longer-term propensity to attract
or export capital.  Misalignment is capable of dis-
torting resource allocation through its impact on
relative prices, of exerting perverse effects on ac-
tivity, employment and the price level, and of
generating protectionist pressures.  In economies

Concern over international financial instabil-
ity reflects the pervasive economic effects of
fluctuations in capital flows and exchange rates
on the prices of goods, services and financial as-
sets, and is related to a number of different issues.
The most important of these issues for
policymakers is misalignment of exchange rates.
Misalignment results from movements of exchange
rates which are extended in time and should be dis-
tinguished from short-term currency volatility.  The

C.  Problems for developed and developing countries
due to financial instability
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with relatively small financial markets - for exam-
ple, those of developing countries - misalignment
due to large capital inflows is also frequently ac-
companied by booms in asset prices, the sequel to
which is likely to be collapse when the capital flows
eventually undergo a reversal.

Difficulties can also result from short-term
volatility of exchange rates.  The severity of these
difficulties varies with the extent to which firms
and other economic agents possess skills of finan-
cial risk management and have access to different
instruments designed for this purpose.  For large
financial firms, as well as for non-financial firms
with well-developed treasury-management func-
tions, the hedging of fluctuations in exchange rates
and other financial variables can be highly effec-
tive.  Such hedging comprises long-established
techniques such as the matching of assets and li-
abilities denominated in different currencies, price
adjustments and invoicing practices, geographical
diversification of operations, the timing of pay-
ments and receipts of foreign exchange, and the
use of instruments such as forward, futures and
options contracts designed to provide protection
against exchange- and interest-rate fluctuations.6

Although the expansion of markets for hedging

instruments in recent years has facilitated the use
of such techniques, it is not possible to achieve
complete protection against financial volatility by
these means.  This impossibility is partly due to
gaps in the coverage of hedging instruments (an
example being the lack of forward and futures con-
tracts for many currencies and maturities) and
partly to the problems posed for current techniques
of financial risk management by fluctuations in
volatility itself outside specified ranges.7  Moreo-
ver for many firms and economic agents, especially
those of developing countries, access to these tech-
niques remains restricted or highly expensive, and
fluctuations in volatility itself can be expected
to be a source of still greater difficulties for
them.

Evidence on the adverse effects of currency
volatility on international trade and other economic
activities is somewhat fragmentary.  There is none
the less widespread belief that short-term currency
volatility abbreviates time horizons for investment
decisions, raises transactions costs and, through
its close relation to volatility of asset prices and
interest rates, increases wealth holders� preferences
for liquid as opposed to longer-term financial in-
struments.8

D.  International regimes and the scope for policy

National policy responses to the threat of ex-
change-rate misalignment posed by unstable
international capital flows are of several kinds, and
are not mutually exclusive since different kinds of
measures may be used to reinforce each other.  One
response is official intervention in the currency
markets in the form of purchases and sales of for-
eign exchange.9  If there are persistent capital
outflows, such a policy on its own will eventually
lead to the exhaustion of a country�s exchange re-
serves and credit lines.  In the case of capital
inflows official intervention causes an increase in
the country�s money supply unless its effects are
sterilized.  However, as is documented from the
experience of selected developing countries in sec-
tion E below, such sterilization usually entails some
loss of control over domestic monetary policy and
may lead to rises in interest rates and unwanted

increases in government indebtedness.  The re-
sponse to capital flows may also include fiscal
tightening, but such action is frequently open to
the objection that in consequence exogenous de-
velopments in international financial markets are
being permitted to override national objectives re-
garding fiscal balance and public expenditure.
Faced with the problems associated with handling
the effects of capital flows solely through some
combination of intervention in exchange markets
and fiscal measures, countries may have recourse
to actions aimed more specifically at the capital
movements themselves.  Some of the measures
under this heading are in the form of taxes or tax-
like restrictions which exercise their effect on
capital transactions by increasing their costs and
thus reducing their profitability.  Other restrictions
involve more direct limits on capital transactions.
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Both categories of restriction have been ex-
tensively used by developed and developing
countries to control outflows and inflows during
the postwar period.10  However, in recent years
OECD countries have become increasingly subject
to self-imposed restraints regarding the use of such
restrictions, embodied in the international legal
regimes for capital transactions.

The only global regime applying to interna-
tional monetary movements is that of IMF.  But
the most important obligations in its Articles of
Agreement relate to current transactions and not
capital movements.  These are set out in Article
VIII (which prescribes the obligation not to im-
pose restrictions on payments and transfers for
current international transactions without the
Fund�s approval) and in Article XIV (which speci-
fies transitional arrangements for countries not yet
willing to accept the obligations of Article VIII).
Concerning international capital movements, Ar-
ticle IV contains, among the general obligations of
IMF members regarding exchange arrangements,
the statement that one of the monetary system�s
essential purposes is the provision of a framework
facilitating the exchange of capital among coun-
tries.11  In more specific references to capital
movements in Article VI, section 3 provides for the
exercise by member countries of such controls as are
necessary to regulate international capital movements
so long as they do not restrict payments for current
transactions.  Section 1 of the same Article gives the
Fund the authority to prevent the use of its resources
to finance a large or sustained capital outflow.

Developed countries, however, are subject to
obligations under the OECD Code of Liberaliza-
tion of Capital Movements and (in the case of
members of EU) under the EEC Council�s 1988
Directive on capital movements and the Maastricht
Treaty.  The OECD Code classifies the great ma-
jority of capital movements into two Lists, A and
B, to the former of which more stringent liberali-

zation obligations apply.  For much of the period
of the Code�s existence List A consisted princi-
pally of operations judged to have fairly close links
to international trade in goods and services and to
longer-term investment, while List B included op-
erations in short-term financial instruments.  But
recently the scope of operations included in List A
was extended to some hitherto covered by List B,
and a number of previously uncovered money-mar-
ket operations were added to List B.

The 1988 EEC Directive on capital move-
ments forbids restrictions on those between
residents of member countries subject only to pro-
visos concerning the control of short-term
movements during periods of financial strain and
certain measures necessary for the functioning of
tax and administrative systems and for prudential
supervision.  Under the Directive member countries are
also committed to endeavour to attain the same degree
of liberalization of capital movements with third coun-
tries as with each other.  The provisions of the 1988
Directive are reinforced by the pertinent articles of the
Maastricht Treaty applying to the second stage of eco-
nomic and monetary union, which began in 1994.  Once
the third stage of this union starts, the imposition
of controls over short-term capital movements dur-
ing periods of financial strain for single-currency
countries will continue to be permitted only with
regard to non-EU countries.

Under current international legal regimes de-
veloping countries, on the other hand, have
considerable latitude regarding controls over in-
ternational capital movements.  Some of them have
none the less undertaken obligations in this area
as part of Treaties of Friendship, Commerce and
Navigation or of regional agreements involving lim-
ited numbers of countries such as the North
American Free Trade Agreement (NAFTA).
Moreover, such obligations may well become more
common as the number and country coverage of
regional agreements expand.

Notable features of the rise in private exter-
nal financing for developing countries and
economies in transition in the 1990s have been its
concentration on a small number of recipients and

the varying character of the flows and of national
policy responses to them.   Both features have im-
plications for the shape of an appropriate
international financial regime and for international

E.  The international financial markets and developing countries:
access and challenges to macroeconomic management
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economic policy more generally.  The extreme un-
evenness of the distribution of external financing
from private sources, which for several develop-
ing countries is associated with tight restrictions
on, or the virtual absence of, access to such fi-
nancing, means that there remains an indispensable
and substantial role in the provision of develop-
ment financing to be played by the official sector.

The variety of responses to increased capital
inflows reflects divergences in the policy objec-
tives and the perceived effectiveness of policy
instruments in recipient countries.  Such diver-
gences point to the need for an international
financial regime with rules that are sufficiently flex-
ible to accommodate a broad gamut of policy
measures on the part of developing countries and
economies in transition regarding the capital ac-
count of the balance of payments.

The concentration of financial flows applies
to all the major categories of financing from inter-
national capital markets.  In recent years more than
three quarters of external bond issues by develop-
ing countries and economies in transition have been
accounted for by four borrowers in Latin America
and five in Asia.  More than 60 per cent of the
value of syndicated international bank lending has
gone to six Asian borrowers.12  High levels of con-
centration, again involving countries which were
also the main recipients of categories of financing
already mentioned, have also characterized inter-
national equity issues, medium-term Euronote
facilities and issues of Eurocommercial paper.
Thus the great majority of developing countries
have not shared in the increase in financing from
the international financial markets of the 1990s.
For example, little money from this source has been
raised in securitized form by countries in sub-Sa-
haran Africa, and net international bank lending
to this region has been widely negative (although a
recent analysis of the figures suggests that this
unfavourable picture may be due in part to defi-
ciencies of countries� reporting systems for
balance-of-payments statistics).13

The breakdown of external financing by major
categories has varied even among the main recipi-
ents, as discussed in more detail above (chapter II,
section B).  For example, FDI as a share of new capi-
tal flows amounted to 70 per cent for Singapore in
the period 1991-1994, while for the Republic of
Korea the corresponding figure was less than 10
per cent.  Generally, bank lending was a relatively
less important source of external financing for

Latin American than for Asian countries, while a
number of Asian countries received relatively lit-
tle financing in the form of international bonds and
international equity issues.

Furthermore, there have been marked differ-
ences in the relation of these capital inflows to
major macroeconomic variables and economic per-
formance in recipient countries, their effects being
determined by, inter alia, the size and composi-
tion of the inflows, exchange controls and
regulations governing inward and outward finan-
cial operations, and the economic policies of the
countries themselves.  Thus in some countries,
particularly certain Asian ones, the inflows were
associated with increases in domestic savings and
investment, whilst in others they were a substitute
for, rather than a complement to, domestic sav-
ings, in consequence contributing much less to
economic performance.  In several of the recipi-
ents an important effect of the inflows has been to
increase the fragility of the domestic banking sys-
tem.  Banks have been tempted by the availability
of external financing at a low cost to finance lo-
cal-currency operations from this source, including
the acquisition of illiquid assets.  The consequence
has been the mismatching of currencies and
maturities, the potentially destabilizing effects of
which have been particularly important in coun-
tries lacking effective systems of prudential
regulation.

Few of the major recipient countries adopted
a largely or completely non-interventionist stance
towards financial inflows.  But considerable dif-
ferences have none the less characterized the
measures taken to ward off misalignment and other
potentially adverse effects.14

There has been widespread recourse by re-
cipient countries to intervention in
foreign-exchange markets to prevent currency ap-
preciation.  However, where capital inflows were
large relative to current-account deficits, such in-
tervention created serious conflicts with domestic
monetary policy objectives.

When intervention was not sterilized, there
resulted rapid increases in money supply which
threatened loss of control of monetary policy.  Very
rarely did the increases reduce interest rates, dis-
courage capital inflows and ease the upward
pressure on the currency.  Fiscal tightening has been
recommended as a way of solving the problems
arising from non-sterilized intervention.  This
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would be achieved, first, by restraining domestic
absorption, and secondly, by generating a budget
surplus to absorb the excess supply of foreign ex-
change, which could be used to reduce
foreign-currency public debt.  However, fiscal policy
has often lacked the flexibility required.  Furthermore,
the scope for generating fiscal surpluses without un-
dermining the efforts to develop human and physical
infrastructure has generally been limited.  Thus, very
few countries have been willing to subordinate the
goals of their fiscal policies to the offsetting of the
impact of external capital flows.

Sterilization of intervention in foreign-ex-
change markets to offset its impact on money
supply and prices through sales of interest-bear-
ing government paper, on the other hand, increases
interest rates, thus accelerating capital inflows.
Indeed, the high-yield short-term government debt
issued as part of the sterilization policy has itself
often become a source of attraction for additional
capital inflows.  Paradoxically, in many cases a
deterioration in the fiscal position has also resulted,
since the rate of interest earned on the increased
exchange reserves thus required was almost always
below that paid on short-term government debt.
These quasi-fiscal deficits also were themselves a
source of increases in money supply in countries
where intervention was sufficiently large and in-
terest differentials were substantial.

Other methods of sterilization have also been
used, including restrictions on domestic credit ex-
pansion through increases in statutory reserve
requirements, window guidance and direct controls,
and increases in discount rates.  Some countries
have also used central bank swaps, selling foreign
currency to domestic financial institutions that are
required to invest it abroad with the implicit guar-
antee that the central bank would make good any
losses due to interest-rate differentials or exchange-
rate adjustments.  However, such methods have
typically provided only temporary relief and, by
creating losses and pushing up interest rates, have
often aggravated the problem to which they were a
response.

The problems associated with sterilized inter-
vention have led to other policy responses to large
capital inflows.  For example, import liberaliza-
tion has been tried as a way of absorbing the excess
supply of foreign exchange.  But such liberaliza-
tion can result in increased import dependence or
higher imports of consumption goods.  The loss of
government revenue due to the tariff reductions

associated with import liberalization can also con-
tribute to fiscal imbalance.

An approach without such adverse side-effects
has been the adoption of more flexible exchange-
rate policies.  The avoidance of rules for official
intervention and of advance announcement of de-
valuations, the widening of currency bands, and
the linking of the currency to a basket of curren-
cies rather than a single benchmark currency can
increase the effectiveness of monetary policy and
slow capital inflows by introducing uncertainty
regarding movements of the exchange rate.  But
this approach involves the risk of sacrificing the
benefits sought from exchange-rate stability.

There has also been increasingly widespread
recourse to more direct controls over capital in-
flows, but with considerable variation among
countries in the extent to which such controls were
integrated into overall balance-of-payments policy
as opposed to constituting an ad hoc response to
the problems caused by the inflows.  For example,
some countries, notably the Republic of Korea,
geared controls to the state of their current account:
when the current account deteriorated, restrictions
on capital outflows were tightened, while those on
inflows were loosened, and vice versa when the
current account recorded a surplus and the cur-
rency came under upward pressure.  The main
strategic consideration in this approach has been
maintaining competitiveness irrespective of
whether the current account was in surplus or defi-
cit.  Capital flows have not been allowed to govern
the exchange rate and the current-account balance,
but rather developments in the latter have dictated
the way in which capital controls were imple-
mented.  Restrictions have been maintained on
holding and issuing foreign-currency assets in the
domestic market, so that shifts between domestic
and foreign assets have been more likely to involve
cross-border transactions.  This has greatly facili-
tated the regulation of capital flows.  Other
countries, in both Latin America and Asia, have
also regulated capital flows successfully but their
approach has been somewhat different.  They have
resorted to regulation of inflows or deregulation
of outflows (or both) only after capital inflows had
already started to undermine competitiveness or to
widen the current-account deficit (or both), or when
intervention in the foreign-exchange market had
already proved problematic for the reasons already
described.  Consequently, these countries have ex-
perienced greater instability of capital flows,
current-account balances and exchange rates.
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The measures used by developing countries
to control capital inflows have included both the
taxes and tax-like restrictions and the other, more
direct, limits on capital transactions mentioned in
section D above.  The measures have often differ-
entiated between FDI and portfolio investment, and
between categories of capital transaction.

One of the more successful instruments of
control, which is designed to close the arbitrage
gap between returns on foreign and domestic as-
sets, has been non-interest-bearing reserve
requirements for inflows.  Variable reserve require-
ments have been applied when setting the reserve
requirement at a single level which did not under-
mine long-term investment proved ineffective in
checking short-term capital inflows.  In such cases
the reserve ratio varied inversely with the matu-
rity of the investment.  Reserve requirements
discourage capital inflows by reducing their net
effective rate of return, thus having an effect much
like a levy on foreign-exchange transactions.  These
reserve requirements were a policy tool independ-
ent of normal prudential regulations.  Some Latin
American countries have also actually imposed
taxes on selected capital inflows.

Risk-adjusted capital requirements have been
applied to banks� and institutional investors� ac-
quisition of assets abroad.  Foreign-currency
deposits, foreign-currency borrowing and interbank
credits have been included in defining the base for

statutory reserve and liquidity requirements.  In
countries which have successfully managed capi-
tal inflows, regulations designed to reduce the
currency mismatch between assets and liabilities
and to restrict open positions in foreign exchange
have typically been a permanent feature of the fi-
nancial system.  A number of quantitative
restrictions have also been deployed, including re-
strictions on issues of external bonds and American
Depository Receipts (ADRs) in the form of speci-
fication of minimum issue sizes and credit rating
for the issuers, the prohibition of sales of money-
market instruments such as Treasury bills to
non-residents, bans on commercial banks� swaps
unrelated to trade, and quantitative limits on off-
shore borrowing by public enterprises and
commercial banks and on forward transactions with
non-residents.

Experience so far suggests that successful
management of capital flows depends on combin-
ing in a flexible and pragmatic manner the tools of
macroeconomic policy with regulations designed
to reduce the volatility of such flows by deterring
interest-rate arbitrage, limiting destabilizing specu-
lation, and avoiding bubbles in asset prices and
exchange rates.  While macroeconomic policies
characterized by consistency and by fiscal and
monetary discipline have been essential prerequi-
sites for the management of capital flows, such
policies needed to be accompanied by other meas-
ures, directly affecting the capital account.

F.  Other global policy actions

1. Introduction

As explained in section D above, OECD coun-
tries have now accepted obligations under the
OECD Code of Liberalization of Capital Move-
ments and the regime of the EU which substantially
restrict their freedom to use capital controls.  Nev-
ertheless, there is continuing discussion in these
countries concerning international policy actions
consistent with these constraints which would have
the aim of producing more orderly financial mar-
kets and of avoiding crises due to volatile capital

movements as well as handling such crises when
they occur.  The actions proposed include finan-
cial integration, macroeconomic policies aimed at
economic convergence, an international lender-of-
last-resort facility, arrangements for preventing
difficult balance-of-payments situations from de-
veloping into full-blown financial crises, new
techniques of official intervention in the currency
markets, improved prudential supervision of firms
engaged in international financing, and various tax
and regulatory measures directed at the reduction
of international financial instability.15  The policy
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actions which are discussed in this section are
mostly directed in the first instance at financial in-
stability and volatile international capital
movements among OECD countries.  But they also
take account of developments due to the integra-
tion of financial markets and its consequences for
developing countries.  Moreover, the benefits of
more orderly financial markets generally would
also extend to developing countries.

2. Monetary union and financial inte-
gration

One way to avoid the problems caused by the
effects on exchange rates of volatile international
capital movements is to introduce a single currency.
Monetary union is not a realistic prospect at a
global level but is envisaged for EU countries under
the Maastricht Treaty.  The attainment of monetary
union is generally believed to require the
convergence of potential members with respect to
key economic criteria - involving for EU the
stability of exchange rates, a specified permissible
deviation of interest rates from a benchmark, and
the avoidance of excessive government debt and
deficits.  However, rules such as those embodied
in the Maastricht Treaty are inherently deflationary
by virtue of their requirement that countries with
excessive deficits should retrench without
corresponding obligations regarding more
expansionary monetary policies or the adoption of
more expansionary fiscal policies by countries
capable of doing so, while still meeting the Treaty�s
fiscal criteria.16  Moreover, the discussion of the
behaviour of exchange rates in section B above
points to doubts that progressive convergence
regarding economic fundamentals will ensure
achievement of the required stability of exchange
rates in the presence of freedom of capital
movements.

Political agreement on the introduction of a
single currency is not the only approach to finan-
cial integration.  An alternative, which might be
described as �bottom upwards�, in contrast to the
�top downwards� instrument of a single currency,
would rely on profit incentives at the level of banks
and other financial institutions for the achievement
of a continuous and orderly process of external-
payments adjustment.17  All restrictions would be
removed on the use of currencies of member coun-
tries, thus making them legal tender throughout the
financially integrated region.  Banks would thus

offer deposits in any of the region�s currencies, and
could consequently be expected to hold foreign-
currency deposits as part of their primary reserves
and short-term foreign currency assets among their
secondary reserves.  An external payments imbal-
ance in any part of the region, whether caused by
flows on current or capital account, would then
require banks in the deficit area to sell foreign-
currency assets, increasing domestic deposits of
banks in the surplus area and decreasing them in
the deficit area.  The interest-rate differentials
which could be expected to result from these ac-
tions by banks would then move in favour of the
deficit area so that banks in the surplus area would
be attracted by the resulting higher yields to ex-
pand their holdings of the deficit area�s assets, thus
automatically generating increased demand for its
currency.

3. Policies for macroeconomic conver-
gence

Macroeconomic policies designed to lead to
convergence with regard to fundamental variables
such as inflation, interest rates and fiscal deficits
are often put forward as the key element of a strat-
egy aimed at achieving greater international
financial stability.  A major difficulty with this
approach would be that of obtaining international
agreement covering the United States, EU coun-
tries (both those eventually entering the monetary
union and those staying outside), Japan and other
countries on the required levels of these fundamen-
tals and on the measures necessary to attain them.
Furthermore, and perhaps more fundamentally, the
evidence discussed above in section B casts doubts
on whether currency markets and international
capital flows are closely connected to economic
fundamentals as presupposed by this approach.
Indeed, experience suggests that the theories un-
derlying advocacy of convergence with regard to
such fundamentals have little or no relation to in-
dicators widely used by actors in financial markets
to guide their decisions concerning their holdings
of different currencies.

4. An international lender of last resort

National central banks typically are called upon
to provide support to financial institutions facing tem-
porary liquidity shortages in order to prevent them
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from growing into more generalized insolvencies.  An
analogous institution at the international level is lack-
ing, although volatile international capital movements
are now capable of subjecting entire economies to
severe strain (often in situations where such move-
ments cannot easily be justified on the basis of the
economies� fundamentals).  An international lender
of last resort would require large financial resources
and access to all major currencies.

A role with several features of an interna-
tional lender of last resort was originally envisaged
for IMF as part of the postwar international finan-
cial system.  However, this role was to apply only
to current-account transactions, and its extension
to capital transactions would require reinterpreta-
tion of Article VI (described above in section D).
Current proposals for a Short-Term Financing
Facility (STFF) are designed to allow IMF to play
a more active role as lender of last resort to devel-
oping, and possibly other, countries.18  Resources
under this Facility might be available for rapid dis-
bursement to offset the impact on countries�
external payments of capital outflows due to
changes in market sentiment and speculative pres-
sures which do not reflect economic fundamentals.
In such situations the Facility would contribute to
the avoidance of excessive currency depreciations
and deflation, and would reduce the risk of default
on external obligations.

The case for such a facility was dramatized
by the recent Mexican crisis.  Establishing it would
require decisions concerning issues such as coun-
try coverage, the procedures for disbursement of
funds, the conditions associated with drawing
rights, the level of access in relation to IMF quo-
tas, the maturity of loans, and the amount of the
facility�s financial resources and the modalities of
raising them.  The size of any such facility presents
a particularly difficult problem, since the finan-
cial support mobilized for countries during recent
currency crises has frequently amounted to large
multiples of existing IMF quotas.  Some of the
problems which would have to be confronted are
indicated by the difficulties being experienced over
the implementation of the initiative of the Group
of Ten to increase the resources of the General
Arrangements to Borrow, which provide a line of
credit to IMF.  Under this initiative the group of
countries which would make available resources
for this line of credit would be expanded, but there
have been disagreements over the association of
the new countries involved in the decision-making
process regarding the use of these resources.

Tighter surveillance of countries� policies and
performance could be expected to accompany the
establishment of a STFF.  Moreover, it would be
reasonable to expect, as a complement to the pro-
vision of an international lender-of-last-resort
facility, pressures for various types of action which
might contribute to more orderly international fi-
nancial markets.19  One proposal frequently put
forward in this context, concerning policies for
macroeconomic convergence, was mentioned
above.  The two which immediately follow were
partly or wholly inspired by the policy debate in
the aftermath of the Mexican crisis, whereas those
taken up subsequently are proposals of longer
standing.

5. More orderly arrangements for handling
emergent external payments problems

The Mexican financial crisis has led to a re-
vival of discussion of formal arrangements for the
handling of external debt and payments problems
which would be less ad hoc than current ones, and
less likely to generate controversy concerning ap-
propriate international policy responses.  Such
arrangements would be intended, inter alia, to pre-
vent incipient problems in a debtor country from
developing into full-blown crises marked by the
collapse of the exchange rate and economic activ-
ity and a threat to its banking system as well as
possible spillover effects on other countries� finan-
cial markets.

One of the more fully articulated proposals20

for this purpose would have the following princi-
pal elements: a signalling role for IMF under which
in appropriate circumstances the Fund would indi-
cate to a debtor country its approval of a temporary
suspension of debt-service payments, subsequently
also disclosing its action to the financial markets
in order to help in the avoidance of a panic; the
creation of a representative bondholders� commit-
tee, which would minimize uncertainty as to the
terms of authority in negotiations on the restruc-
turing of debts in the form of external bonds; a
mediation and conciliation service designed to
speed negotiations between the debtor and the bond-
holders� council; changes in bond covenants
designed to permit a majority of creditors to alter
the terms in the interest of the speedy settlement of
debt restructurings, thus preventing small minori-
ties from holding up the progress of negotiations;
and an arbitral tribunal to which dissident credi-
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tors could have eventual recourse - an arrangement
which, it is hoped, would make contractual inno-
vations regarding bond covenants more palatable.
The role of IMF under this proposal would be
closely related to that envisaged for it in the event
of the establishment of a STFF.  Solutions to the
problems of countries imposing temporary stand-
stills on debt-service payments would be found
primarily through negotiations with creditors.  But
IMF would be provided with additional resources
which would be available for rapid disbursement
in situations where the stability of the debtor�s
banking system was threatened, there was a dan-
ger of contagion in the form of the spread of
instability to other emerging financial markets, or
the run on the debtor country had a self-fulfilling
character unconnected to weak fundamentals.

The proposal�s contribution to more orderly
financial markets would depend on whether an
IMF-approved standstill on debt-service payments
preceding recourse to more orderly arrangements
for working out a debtor�s problems would pre-
vent a run by investors.  The authors believe that
in the case of Mexico in late 1994 approval by the
Fund of a suspension of debt-service payments on
tesobonos and cetes would have helped to contain
the crisis by halting the run on Mexican assets,
thus eliminating the need to bail out private inves-
tors with public funds, though not necessarily
avoiding many of the other adverse developments
such as the spillover effects on other financial
markets.21  In their view, however, the policy re-
sponse to the Mexican crisis is extremely unlikely
to be repeated, and their proposal would contribute
to reducing the instability associated with future cri-
ses, since it would be known in advance that massive
rescue packages would no longer be forthcoming.
Doubts regarding their proposal concern the difficulty
of anticipating both the dynamics of international fi-
nancial crises and creditors� responses.

6. International standards of prudential
supervision

At the national level the regulatory framework
for financial systems includes not only a lender-
of-last-resort facility and orderly arrangements for
handling insolvencies but also prudential supervision
of financial firms.  Recent years have witnessed ef-
forts to develop an international regime of prudential
supervision which would cover the rapidly expand-
ing cross-border operations of such firms.

International initiatives to improve the pru-
dential supervision of banks with such operations
date from the 1970s, and were a response to the
awareness of regulatory authorities in countries
with large financial centres that a major banking
default could have a destabilizing effect that ex-
tended beyond the jurisdiction in which it took
place.  The main sources of these initiatives have
been the Basle Committee on Banking Supervision
and the Bank for International Settlements (BIS).22

The early work of the Basle Committee was con-
cerned with strengthening the standards of
prudential supervision of international banks and
improving international supervisory cooperation,
better internal controls for banks� international
credit risks and internationally uniform standards
for the capital set aside for banks� credit risks.
More recently the Basle Committee�s attention has
been turned to capital requirements for market
risks, namely risks due to changes in the prices of
different components of banks� trading books.
Other bodies associated with BIS have focused on
reducing the risks of payments and settlement sys-
tems, the development of statistics for the global
market for foreign exchange and closely related
financial instruments, and supervisory and account-
ing standards for financial conglomerates.  These
initiatives can be expected to contribute to greater
financial strength and improved risk management
for international banks.

The effects of these initiatives are not limited to
members of the Basle Committee and BIS.  Stand-
ards promulgated by the Basle Committee are
accepted in many other countries.  This process will
be reinforced by the insistence of many countries
during the negotiations on financial services in WTO
on inclusion of observance of these standards by regu-
lators in banks� home countries among conditions for
the granting of market access.  However, the main
focus of international supervisory initiatives has been
default risk.  Better internal controls and improved
allocation of capital to banks� different activities may
reduce, but will not eliminate, their involvement in
speculation.  Moreover, the remit of banking super-
visors in many countries does not include non-bank
securities firms (whose supervisory bodies are repre-
sented in other multilateral organizations, such as the
International Organization of Securities Commissions
(IOSCO)), let alone the increasing number of non-
financial institutions which now take large positions
in the international financial markets.  The activities
of these non-bank participants in the markets are
widely believed to be major sources of recent inter-
national financial volatility.
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7. Capital requirements and restraining
currency speculation

Suggestions have been put forward for more
direct use of prudential regulation regarding banks�
capital as an instrument for restraining currency
speculation.  The primary function of banks� capi-
tal is to absorb losses which might otherwise
threaten their continued operation.  But if the size
of balance-sheet positions permitted under bank-
ing regulations is linked to the capital supporting
them, such requirements can also restrict the scale
of banks� involvement in particular activities.
Accordingly, it has been proposed that an interna-
tionally agreed surcharge should be imposed on
capital requirements for banks� open positions in
foreign exchange so as to increase the costs to them
of currency speculation.23  The agreement would
have to extend to all financial centres to prevent
its frustration by the flight of currency trading to
jurisdictions where the surcharge did not apply.

A major problem to which such a surcharge
on a permanent basis would give rise is that it
would be at variance with the approach to manag-
ing market risks embodied in the procedures for
determining capital requirements for such risks
adopted by the Basle Committee at the beginning
of 1996.24  Under these procedures, which are in-
tended to serve as the basis for regulations which
will be implemented by the end of 1997, banks will
be permitted to use proprietary risk-management
systems to measure market risks.  The core of these
procedures is the setting of a bank�s capital charge
on the basis of a measure generated by its in-house
model of the value at risk of its trading book, that is
to say of the maximum loss on the trading book ex-
pected during some period at a specified level of
confidence.  Some allowance for offsetting correla-
tion effects between broad categories of risk (interest
rates, exchange rates, equity and commodity prices)
will be permitted, so that the market risk associated
with foreign exchange positions will not be segre-
gated.  Use of an alternative method for calculating
capital requirements, which does segregate positions
in foreign exchange and precious metals, is also pos-
sible, but widespread use by banks of proprietary
models to generate their capital requirements will
mean that estimation of these requirements will not
be carried out on a uniform basis.  Thus, while the
imposition of capital charges as a measure to restrain
currency speculation remains a policy option, such
action would now be at variance with the approach
to managing market risks embodied in the 1996 guide-

lines of the Basle Committee.  Recourse to such
charges seems more likely as part of an emergency
policy response to a crisis in the foreign-exchange
markets than as a measure imposed on a more per-
manent basis (in spite of the likelihood that their
effectiveness will often be limited in such circum-
stances).

8. New methods of intervention in foreign-
exchange markets

Recent financial innovations designed to fa-
cilitate risk management have furnished new
opportunities not only for private-sector partici-
pants in international financial markets but also
for monetary authorities.  There is a long tradition
of intervention by central banks not only in the spot
but also in the forward foreign-exchange market.
Creation of forward markets as a vehicle for inter-
vention was urged by Keynes during the interwar
period.  In view of the relationship of forward pre-
miums to international interest-rate differentials,
Keynes proposed intervention in the forward mar-
ket by the central bank as a way of influencing
capital flows without changing official interest
rates.  The possibility of defending the spot ex-
change rate in this way at no immediate cost to
official reserves has been extensively analysed in
the literature,25 and such intervention played an
important part in the defence of sterling in the
1960s.  Forward exchange contracts are a form of
derivative instrument, so that unsurprisingly the
recent proliferation of derivatives has been accom-
panied by proposals for the use by central banks
of the new instruments for the purpose of hedging
their foreign exchange reserves and of interven-
tion in the foreign exchange market.

For example, the former Director of the Group
of Thirty has proposed that central banks purchase
far-out-of-the-money put options on their curren-
cies as a technique for defending the exchange rate
against the effects of large speculative outflows.26

The technique would have relatively low costs since
the out-of-the-money options would have low pre-
miums.  In the event of downward pressure on the
currency, the options could be exercized, thereby
providing additional reserves to limit the depre-
ciation.  The reserves could also be used to sterilize
the funds used to exercize the put contract.

There are many other potential uses of
options for official intervention in the foreign-
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exchange markets.  For example, the sale of cov-
ered calls on foreign currency could also be used
as part of the defence of an upper limit for a coun-
try�s exchange rate.  Likewise, in order to prevent
an undesired currency appreciation due to exces-
sive capital inflows, the central bank might write
put options on a foreign currency.  The Hannoun
Report even raised the possibility that by writing
currency options and thus reducing option premi-
ums central banks might also reduce implied
volatility, thus producing a desired signalling ef-
fect helping to counter disorder in the
foreign-exchange market.27  However, the ultimate
result of such intervention is not clear, since
changes in prices due to reduced implied volatility
would have an additional effect on the delta hedg-
ing of options positions by dealers.28

Derivative products clearly provide banks
with additional instruments for intervening in for-
eign-exchange markets, but two caveats are in
order.  Firstly, not only must a market for options
in the currency exist (a condition which is likely to
require the existence of a futures market, as most
options are written on futures contracts), but also,
if intervention via options is to provide an effec-
tive alternative to that in the forward market, the
market for options should be reasonably liquid.
Secondly, a central bank might have to confront
criticism, similar to that which it faces if it fails to
defend its currency through intervention in the for-
ward market, that it has provided the counterpart
of speculators� profitable forward sales.  Where
the recourse to put options is a means of defence
against capital outflows the criticism might take
the form that the central bank was speculating
against its own currency and, if its initiative were
successful, that it had generated profits for banks
in exchange for instruments which had expired
unused.

9. Taxation of foreign-exchange trans-
actions

In recent debate on ways to control instabil-
ity in the international financial markets there has
been much discussion of the idea of taxing for-
eign-exchange transactions, originally proposed by
James Tobin in the 1970s.29  Such a tax, which has
also attracted interest as a potential source of rev-
enue for various internationally agreed purposes,
presents a series of difficult, though not necessar-
ily insuperable, practical problems.  Decisions

would be necessary concerning the locations at
which the tax would be imposed, the level of the
tax, and the coverage of instruments.

The question of location has been subjected
to a thorough discussion by Kenen in a recent vol-
ume on different aspects of the Tobin tax.30  Kenen
plumps for the location or locations at which the
deal is made in preference to the site or sites at
which the deal is booked (which would not be iden-
tical if booking is done at the head offices of the
overseas branches of the dealers� banks) or to the
country in which settlement takes place (when set-
tlement, for example, involves the transfer of sums
between banks� correspondents).  One difficulty
frequently raised in connection with the Tobin tax
is the possibility that some financial centres would
refuse to impose it, with the consequence, as in the
analogous case of a surcharge on banks� capital
requirements discussed in the preceding sub-sec-
tion, that these centres would attract large amounts
of additional currency trading from other locations.
Kenen also suggests a possible solution to this
problem, namely the taxing of transactions with
tax-free trading sites at a punitive rate.  But, as he
admits, while this could act as a strong disincen-
tive to the migration of currency trading to smaller
financial centres, it would not be an effective re-
sponse to the refusal of a major financial centre
already used by many traders (say, London) to join
the scheme.

Decisions on the level and coverage of the tax
cannot be divorced from consideration of its likely
effects.  Yet conclusions as to these effects are still
speculative.  Proponents of the tax have noted the
way in which the expansion of currency trading
has been accompanied by increased exchange-rate
volatility.  Thus, if the tax succeeds in reducing
the volume of trading, so the argument continues,
it should also reduce volatility.31  There is indeed
evidence that low percentage taxes or charges can
have significant effects on both the levels and the
character of financial transactions.  To take one
recent example, the fee of 10 basis points imposed
by the Federal Reserve on daylight overdrafts in
April 1994 reduced their amount by 40 per cent in
the subsequent six months.32  Another example is
given in analysis of the stock market crash of Oc-
tober 1987 in the publication, The Quality of
Markets Report, which attributed the limited role
of programme trading in London at that time partly
to tax and stamp duty.33  More mundanely it should
also be recalled that mutual funds sometimes im-
pose exit fees on shareholders which vary inversely
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with the holding period.34  These charges act as a
disincentive to herd selling by shareholders (though
the consequent impact on the funds� investment
managers is only indirect).

Quantitative research on the relation between
trading volume and volatility is to be found mainly
in studies of stock markets, which have investi-
gated such subjects as the influence of the absence
of trading on the volatility of daily returns on
stocks35 and the effects on stock markets of the
introduction of transaction taxes or of increases in
transaction costs.  Two studies under the latter
heading are of special interest in the context of the
Tobin tax.  The first36 shows that the introduction
of transaction taxes in the Swedish stock market
caused an increase in volatility, and that daily vola-
tility was greatest when the tax was at its highest
level.  The second37 concerns the effects on vola-
tility of the elimination in May 1975 of the New
York Stock Exchange�s 193-year-old system of
fixed commission rates, and the results confirm the
lack of an inverse relation between the level of
transaction charges and volatility.  Although the
conclusions of these studies are not directly appli-
cable to the foreign-exchange market, they should
give pause to advocates of transaction taxes for
restraining volatility in that area.

The difficulties of forecasting the effect of the
introduction of a Tobin tax are enhanced by the
complexity of the techniques through which trad-
ers now take positions in the foreign-exchange
market.  These positions often involve combina-
tions of transactions, including recourse to
derivatives.  As a result, currency volatility de-
pends on trading behaviour in a number of different,
though closely related, markets.  To be effective, a
transaction tax should thus presumably apply to
all these markets.  But owing to this multiplicity
of markets, forecasting the effects of a transaction
tax becomes correspondingly harder.

A tax with the required comprehensiveness
with regard to coverage of instruments and trans-
actions would entail the solution of several
awkward and sometimes novel problems of tax
design.  Spot and forward foreign-exchange trans-
actions seem relatively straightforward: the tax
could be assessed at a percentage rate of the trans-
actions� value.  Since foreign-exchange swaps,
which combine simultaneous spot and forward
transactions, are typically priced in the market as
a single transaction, they might be treated in the
same way for the purpose of the tax, being assessed

on the same basis as simple spot or forward deals.
But this does not exhaust the problems of tax de-
sign for these transactions since, for example, the
timing of the tax obligation must still be decided.
Currency futures might also be taxed at a percentage
rate on the notional value of the contract.  In this
case the tax, if imposed when the contract is initi-
ated, would have an effect on cash flow similar to an
increase in the initial margin.38  For currency swaps39

the transaction tax might be imposed on the streams
of netted payments40 and on exchanges of principal,
since these payments seem to correspond most natu-
rally to the actual foreign-exchange transactions
associated with such swaps.

Designing a transaction tax for currency op-
tions is likely to be particularly difficult.  One
solution might be to tax them only when they are
exercised.  However, this would leave untaxed op-
tions positions settled through offsetting in the
options market (i.e. in the form of sales of con-
tracts by longs or buyers, and purchases by shorts
or sellers), and could be expected to enhance the
attractiveness of currency options in comparison
with other transactions as an instrument for hedg-
ing and portfolio management as well as for
currency speculation.  Stiglitz has proposed tak-
ing an option�s strike price as the base for the
transaction tax.41  Puts and calls would then be
taxed at 50 per cent of the rate applying to other
foreign-exchange transactions, the rationale being
that the pay-off to a long position in a call com-
bined with a short position in a put at a time near
the maturity of the contracts is approximately
equivalent to the pay-off on an investment in the
underlying asset.42  But this equivalence applies
when the exercise price of the option is equal to
the price of the underlying asset and thus does not
hold in all circumstances.  Nevertheless, the idea
may point towards a fruitful approach to tax de-
sign for currency options, namely the
breaking-down of options positions into equivalent
combinations of other contracts for which the de-
sign of transaction taxes is easier.

10. Alternatives to the Tobin Tax

A number of alternatives to Tobin�s proposal
have been advanced with similar objectives.  These
are framed to avoid problems such as those due to
the difficulty of defining what is and what is not a
foreign-exchange transaction.  Dornbusch, for ex-
ample, has proposed taxing all cross-border



176 Trade and Development Report, 1996

payments.43  While this approach has the virtue of
simplicity, it would not eliminate all forms of eva-
sion, since it  would not be applicable to
back-to-back transactions.44  Moreover, since it
adds to the costs of a wider variety of transactions
than the Tobin tax, there is a risk that the proposal
would meet with correspondingly stronger politi-
cal resistance.  The proposal is also open to the
objection that the tax would be borne disproportion-
ately by current, rather than capital, transactions.

An alternative to taxing foreign-exchange
transactions for the purpose of reducing currency
speculation, and one which might naturally occur
to many economists, would be to tax the short-term
profits of currency trading at a punitive rate.45

Such a tax might be regarded as an instrument de-
signed to achieve objectives analogous to those
sought for stock trading from the 100 per cent tax
on short-term gains proposed by the famous United
States investor, Warren Buffet.46  An internation-
ally agreed tax of this kind would have to raise the
taxation of short-term profits from currency trad-
ing to a uniform level if it were not simply to lead
to the transfer of foreign-exchange business to
lightly taxed jurisdictions.47  Putting such a tax in
place would seem a tall order, but the problems
involved are none the less worth a somewhat closer
examination.

Profits from trading, including that in curren-
cies, are generally already subject to taxation, so
that the base for an internationally agreed tax could
be readily identified.  But pre-existing tax systems
would pose difficulties to the design of a supple-
mentary international tax.  These systems vary
considerably among countries and, in respect of
the newer instruments through which foreign-ex-
change positions can be taken, are often
underdeveloped.48  Moreover, in several countries
the systems incorporate concepts inconsistent with
the across-the-board approach on which an inter-
nationally agreed tax on trading profits would
presumably have to be based.

For example, in many countries the tax treat-
ment of profits associated with positions in
currency futures and currency swaps depends on
whether they are held for the purpose of hedging
or speculation, the distinction frequently being re-
lated to the corresponding accounting treatment.49

Since the objective of taxing short-term profits on
foreign-exchange trading would be precisely to
restrain speculation, there might seem to be an ar-
gument for incorporating the same distinction in

the internationally agreed tax.  However, achiev-
ing agreement on this subject, as on many other
technical aspects of such a tax, could be expected
to be, if anything, still more difficult than on the
practicalities of a transaction tax.

11. Concluding remarks

Discussion of ways to bring greater stability
to international financial markets has so far proved
inconclusive.  Those emphasizing the need for poli-
cies to achieve the �right� levels of fundamentals
appear to ignore the frequently tenuous connec-
tion between fundamentals and the decisions of
participants in the foreign-exchange market.  Those
who put forward measures directed at the proc-
esses associated with transactions have to confront
the difficulty of delimiting the foreign-exchange
market and dealing with the wide-ranging effects
of rapid financial innovation.

For some financial markets their institutional
structures make possible the imposition of rules
designed to keep speculation within bounds and to
prevent excessively large short-term movements of
prices.  These rules include daily price limits, cir-
cuit breakers under which trading is halted if prices
fall by specified amounts, and position limits re-
stricting the number of contracts which a speculator
may hold.  However, the global nature of the for-
eign-exchange market and the multiple channels
linking it to the markets for other financial assets
seem to rule out the application to it of such meas-
ures.50  In consequence, there have been calls for
the establishment of a central clearinghouse for
foreign-exchange transactions, but technical, finan-
cial, organizational and political impediments make
the idea seem utopian.

Financial innovation has in recent years pro-
duced an environment in which not only have there
been large changes in the elements of financial
markets that are the subject of tax and regulatory
measures but also the traditional conceptual frame-
work for classifying these elements has lost some
of its relevance.  Of special importance in the lat-
ter connection is the way in which derivative
instruments have eliminated any sharp distinction
between long- and short-term investments, with the
result that the traditional association of an invest-
ment�s maturity with its degree of permanence no
longer holds as it once did.  Derivatives now make
it possible to construct synthetic equivalents of
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instability tends to peak in the aftermath of peri-
ods of disorder in the currency markets,
progressively subsiding as calm returns.  It is pos-
sible to conceive a future in which periods of
disorder would become less frequent and their ef-
fects less pervasive.  For example, monetary union
may be successfully introduced in the EU, its cov-
erage being progressively extended to more member
States, while improved risk management and tighter
control of open foreign-exchange positions within
financial firms could easily reduce their involve-
ment in speculation.  But even this optimistic scenario
would leave important parts of the foreign-exchange
markets open to the influence of speculative forces,
and more pessimistic scenarios can also be envisaged.
If the misalignments and volatility which are associ-
ated with foreign-exchange instability persist, they
are capable of threatening countries� trading relations
and more generally of posing a challenge to greater
coherence in global economic policy making, a goal
now publicly endorsed by Governments.52

long-term investments through the combination
of such instruments with positions in short-term
assets.  As a result, there is a risk that the ben-
efits of any reduction of speculation due to
increased transaction charges (following, say,
introduction of a Tobin tax) might be offset by
the costs of disrupting arbitrage processes and
what are now normal methods of managing cross-
border financial risks.  Moreover, international
agreement on the imposition of increased transac-
tion charges would have to be reached in
circumstances in which those responsible for na-
tional frameworks of taxation and regulation are
struggling to adapt them to what one famous ana-
lyst of financial markets has called �the new
financial world�.51

However, the difficulties of international ac-
tion to control financial instability should not divert
attention from the possible adverse economic conse-
quences of such instability.  Concern over financial
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